
Recent Quotes & Design Wins 

Ohio - IEC Module-  Data Acquisition Equip. 

Utah - Power Cord - Food Preservers 

New Jersey - HGN Filter - Power Supply 

Massachusetts - Pin & Sleeve - Laser Equipment   

S. California -  HEC2 - Commercial Diving Equip. 

Pennsylvania -  Pin & Sleeve - Commercial Kiln 

N. California -  Power Cord - 3D Modeling 
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PDI Points of Interest 

 

 Contact Josh Norkin to 

help with all of your 

customer service needs and 

sales inquiries (x225) 

jnorkin@powerdynamics.com 

 When online, click eTasks 

for real time inventory, 

specifications, pricing & 

order status 

 Warehousing in NJ & CA 

 Custom Designs 

 Value added wire harnesses 

to most of our products 

Since 1979Since 1979   

PDI 
Power Dynamics, Inc. 

® 

PDI Representation 

 

New York State 
Empire Technical Sales 
Please contact Rick Wray at 
(315) 685-5703 for your local 
opportunities. 
 

N. California 
IWI Associates 
Please contact Barbara Weber 
at (408) 353-4478 for your 
local opportunities. 
 

S. California 
Quadrep 
Please contact Bill Myers at 
(949) 429-6670 for your local 
opportunities. 

Battery Holders 
Harsh / Waterproof 
Connectors 

  
Pin & Sleeve for 
Wire Harnesses 

IP67 & IP68 

Power Dynamics has an 
extensive selection of 
battery holders that satisfy 
requirements for durable 
corrosion resistance 
designs.  All are 
competitively priced.   

Please contact Sales with 
battery, wire and terminal 
specifications for a 
competitive quotation and 
detailed specifications. 

Available for AAA, AA, 9V, 
C, D, N & coin cells 

Power Dynamics Harsh 
Environment connectors 
are waterproof while 
mated and are available in 
various cable, panel and pc 
mount configurations.  

Power: up to 30A, 500V      
Locking Type: Threaded & 
           Bayonet 
Contacts: up to 12                 
Wire Gauge: 11 AWG max 
Terminal Type: Solder, PC 
  & Crimp            
Mating Cycles: >500 

The connectors are 
designed for harsh 
environments. 

Contact PDI for more 
information 

IN STOCK!               
B23 

Durable 9v panel mount 
battery holder with drawer 

Call for a quote! 

Power Dynamics is having 
great success with the Pin 
& Sleeve plugs/connectors 
at cable assembly / wire 
harness assemblers.   

Applications 

These assemblies can be 
used for many types of 

OEM applications like 
PDU’s (power distribution), 
industrial equipment, floor 
polishers, portable power, 

portable generators, data 
centers & stage lighting to 
name a few. 

Please contact your local 
wire/cable assembly house 
for potential Pin & Sleeve 
opportunities. 

Pin & Sleeve wire harness 


